EIR FOI and SAR Disclosure Report

Enquiry Reference |Description [ Enquiry [ Appeal
Closed ithi Received
Date
EIR Request ———————
PE\2021\ENQ\41596 EIR received via "WhatDoTheyKnow' 10 Feb 2021 09 Mar 2021 09 Mar 2021 YES
Information re Warslow Moors Estate Wader Protection
contract.
RESPONSE:

09/03/2021 - Final response, some information provided.
Figures refused citing Req 12(5)(g) - protection of the
environment.

PE\2020\ENQ\41215 EIR - In the Peak Parks Press release dated the 13 of 15 Dec 2020 13 Jan 2021 13 Jan 2021 YES NO
April 2018 the authority refers to recently approved local
needs houses in Winster and Taddington and a scheme
they were working on in Tideswell.

Also the Tideswell scheme was referred to in item 11
paragraph 45 of the 11 December 2020 planning
Committee meeting written by []

I wish to make a Freedom of Information request for:-

1. The reference planning numbers for the Taddington
local needs application talked about in your 2018 press
release and any additional information which is not held
under the reference numbers when a planning search is
carried out.

2. Application NP/DDD/0120/0074 in Litton Dale that was



PE\2020\ENQ\41245

passed on the 13 of July 2020, I would like any
additional information that is not available under a
planning search reference numbers.

3. I also wish to make a freedom of information request
for all the information you have on the Tideswell
affordable local needs scheme referred to in 2018 press
release and item 11 paragraph 45 of last Fridays
planning meeting.

Can you please let me know the date the above
information will be available by?

RESPONSE:
13/01/2021 - information provided, with some redaction
for personal data.

EIR - Derwent and Hope Woodlands Parish Council 23 Dec 2020 20 Jan 2021
hereby requests copies of the records of all

communications by letter, electronic means, telephone

conversations and meetings between any member of the

PDNPA and:

Severn Trent Water

Fisher German

Rob Garnham (Mediation in Planning)

Baynes and Mitchell Architects

Summers-Inman

Artelia

Environmental Dimension Partnership

The leaseholders of the kiosk at the Fairholmes Visitor
Centre

from 1st January 2017 to 22nd December 2020
appertaining to the proposed development of a new
building at the Fairholmes Visitor Centre to include a
cafe, Dambusters exhibition, a changing places facility
and enlarged toilets.

21 Jan 2021 YES

NO



PE\2020\ENQ\41166

PE\2021\ENQ\41675

In order to help determine the status of this application
with regard to cost, the parish council requests a waiver
of all fees because disclosure of the information is in the
public interest. It will contribute significantly to our
community's understanding of the relationship between
the PDNPA and Severn Trent Water and their associates
with respect to the proposed development.

RESPONSE:

20/01/2021 - final response, some information provided,
Some withheld citing Reg 12(5)(f) interests of person
providing the information.

EIR - Request for copies of any correspondence and
meeting notes relating to the Peak District Bird of Prey
Initiative from July 2019 - to present.

To avoid doubt I would like to see any correspondence
between the Peak District National Park Authority and
the Moorland Association or it's representatives, the
National Gamekeepers Organisation or it's
representatives any police force, the raptor groups
involved in the initiative, any of the landowners in the
peak district and or their representatives and any
internal discussions relating to aspects of the Initiative.

INITIAL RESPONSE:
17/12/2020 - request for extension of time until
03/02/2021

03/02/2021 - final response, information provided with
redactions for personal data and protected species site
locations.

EIR: Application NP/DDD/0117/0040 - Town End Yard,
Tideswell was granted on the 12/2/2021, and there is

09 Dec 2020 03 Feb 2021 03 Feb 2021 YES

15 Feb 2021 11 Mar 2021 12 Mar 2021 YES

NO

NO


https://hub/link/Information_Access_Enquiry?ref=PE%5C2020%5CENQ%5C41166

PE\2021\ENQ\41375

little information on your site since the planning
committee meeting on the July 2017 to the application
being granted. Also the minutes of the meeting for the
planning committee meeting date 14 July 2017 does not
state who proposed and seconded and who voted for,
against or abstained.

Can you please supply this information and check if there
are any additional documents to be sent to me. Eg was
there an officer report that went with the granting of the
planning permission on the 12/2/2021. What other
documents were there from Feb 2017 to 2021 other than
those on your planning application search.

I will have a think about whether I need the
correspondence with the agent in connection with
planning application reference NP/DDD/0117/0040 that
deals with post-decision discussions re layout and
conditions.

RESPONSE:
11/03/2021 - Final response, information not held,
explanation provided.

EIR - request on behalf of client. We understand that 06 Jan 2021 02 Feb 2021
you would be able to assist our client in obtaining any

documents or information regarding the alleged illegal

waste tipping at the farm from Peak Park via a Freedom

of Information request Please could you let me know

what you require from us in order to provide us with any

information that Peak Park holds in respect of the

alleged illegal waste tipping at King Sterndale Hall Farm,

Buxton, Derbyshire, SK17 9SF.

RESPONSE:
02/02/2021 - information provided under EIR 2004,
some information exempt under Reg (5)(3) - personal

02 Feb 2021 YES

NO



PE\2020\ENQ\41137

PE\2020\ENQ\41132

PE\2021\ENQ\41421

information of requestor. Supplied under Art 15, subject
access rights (SAR) of GDPR 2016.

EIR - Request under the freedom of information act in 07 Dec 2020 04 Jan 2021
relation to letter received from yourselves on 2/12/2020

reference 19/0021 and information about the complaints

received about Three Trees Bungalow, Brierlow Bar,

Buxton, Derbyshire SK17 9PY.

RESPONSE:
04/01/2020 - final response, transcript of enquiries
provided.

EIR - copies of all the correspondence including emails 13 Dec 2020 13 Jan 2021
between any party to be disclosed on the following

planning applications, this additional information does

not come up on the planning search:

NP/DDD/0117/0040
NP/DDD/0720/0606
NP/DDD/0520/0425
NP/HPK/0220/0158

10/12/2020 - request on hold
13/12/2020 - request re-instated

RESPONSE:

13/01/2020 - final response, some information provided.
Exempt information under Reg 13(1) EIR - personal
information of third party, contravene principle a of
GDPR

EIR - Received via 'WhatDoTheyKnow' 21 Jan 2021 16 Feb 2021
Can you please advise if you have any byelaws relating

to the use of UAVs from your land, and if so can you

please elder provide a copy or the link to their location

on a website.

05 Jan 2021 YES

13 Jan 2021 YES

17 Feb 2021 YES

NO

NO

NO



If you do not have any byelaws, do you have any other
policies relating to the use of UAVs on your land?

Can you finally advise if these have been reviewed in
relation to CQP722C.

RESPONSE:

16/02/2021 - final response, link to FAQ on website and
redacted copy of Bye Laws for open access land
provided.

e S S

PE\2021\ENQ\41287 FOI - I noticed from your website that the NPA has in 18 Dec 2020 18 Jan 2021 18 Jan 2021 YES
recent years made several permanent traffic regulation
orders prohibiting motor vehicles from using some of the
Park's green lanes. I live in the North York Moors
National Park and we are having terrific problems with
the inappropriate and unsustainable use of our green
lanes by off-road motor vehicles and I would be grateful
if you could confirm roughly how much it costs to make
such an order.

It is just the cost of implementing the Wetton Hills TRO
that I was interested the NPA have already very kindly
sent me the costs for Derby Lane and Washgate.

See also PE\2020\ENQ\33013.

RESPONSE:

18/01/2021 - We're not able to deal with the part-time
rights of way officer post on a pro rata basis, but
instead it's viewed that this is delivered alongside other
green lanes work, as facilitated by the

post. For the employment of a part-time Rights of Way
Officer, including on-costs: £18,455

annually.

Advertising costs: £501.18



PE\2020\ENQ\41240

PE\2021\ENQ\41935

External legal fees: £4250
Signage: £381

FOI - 22 Dec 2020 05 Jan 2021
1. Do you currently have any Al enabled chatbots

engaging with Citizens directly? If not, do you intend to

introduce this in the next 12 months?

If you are looking to introduce Al enabled chatbots in
the next 12 months, then please advise us on who is
best to contact regarding this. (Name, Job Title and
Email address)

2. Do you currently have a live webchat to engage with
Citizens live on your website? If not, do you intend to
introduce this in the next 12 months?

If you are looking to introduce live Webchat in the next
12 months, then please advise us on who is best to
contact regarding this. (Name, Job Title and Email
address)

RESPONSE:
05/01/2021 - do not currently use and no plans to
introduce in next 12 months.

FOI - I am writing to request the following information 16 Mar 2021 17 Mar 2021
regarding funerals arranged by the Council under Section
46 Public Health Act.

1. How many such funerals has the Council arranged
since 1st January 2020?

2. In each case please disclose:

a) The name and last residential address of the deceased
b) The deceased's dates of birth and death

¢) Whether the deceased's next of kin/family members
have been traced

d) Whether the deceased's estate has been referred to

20 Jan 2021 YES

12 Apr 2021 YES

NO

NO



PE\2021\ENQ\41872

the Government Legal Department or elsewhere

3. Has the Council passed this information to any other
individual or organisation (either formally through a FOI
request or by other means)?

4. Does the Council work with any genealogist? If so,
which?

5. Does the Council publish a list of Public Health
Funerals it has arranged? If so:

a) Where is the list published (please provide web url if
on-line)?

b) How often is the list updated?

¢) When was the list last updated?

6. Who in the Council is responsible for the Council's
Public Health Funerals? Please advise us of their names
and contact details.

RESPONSE:
17/03/2021 - information note held, refer to Disrict and
County Councils

FOI - This is a request for information under the 08 Mar 2021 11 Mar 2021
Freedom of Information Act 2000. I would like to request
the following information:

- Total visitor numbers for 2018

- The proportion and number of visitors in 2018 who
were aged 18-30

- Total visitor numbers for 2019

- The proportion and number of visitors in 2019 who
were aged 18-30

- Total visitor numbers for 2020

- The proportion and number of visitors in 2020 who
were aged 18-30

I would like to receive the information in an electronic
format. If you feel that a substantive response to this
request is not possible within a reasonable time frame,
or the request is too broad, I would be grateful if you
could contact me by email [T and provide assistance as

02 Apr 2021 YES

NO



PE\2021\ENQ\41814

PE\2021\ENQ\41379

to how I could refine the request.

RESPONSE:
11/03/2021 - final response, information note held

FOI Request for : 02 Mar 2021 04 Mar 2021

1. How many staff have undergone unconscious bias
training over the last five calendar years? Please could
you break down the number by year for 2021 (up to and
including the end of February), 2020, 2019, 2018 and
2017.

2. How much money has been spent unconscious bias
training for staff over the last five calendar years? Please
could you break down the figure by year for 2021 (up to
and including the end of February), 2020, 2019, 2018
and 2017. In each case where there has been
expenditure on unconscious bias training, please could
you state which company the money went to, how
much, and the date of the payment.

3. If unconscious bias training has been provided to
staff, please could you provide details of the format of
the training is - its title, how many hours/days the
training lasts, and any other relevant detail which
summarises what it entails.

4. If possible, please could you provide a copy of any
training material - documentation including, but not
limited to, training packs, worksheets, fact sheets etc -
distributed to staff as part of the unconscious bias
training in any of the above years. Please note, if this is
not possible, please proceed with the remainder of the
request.

RESPONSE:
04/03/2021 - Final response, information provided.

FOI - Received via 'WhatDoTheyKnow' 18 Jan 2021 21 Jan 2021
- Do you currently have any paper documents in

29 Mar 2021 YES

12 Feb 2021 YES

NO

NO



storage?

- If any, or all of your documents have been securely
digitised, do you have any bespoke software to
electronically access and manage scanned images?

- Who is the senior officer/s (outside of procurement)
responsible for the management of physical records?"

RESPONSE:
21/01/2021 - final response, information provided.

PE\2021\ENQ\41832 FOI - received via WhatDoTheyKnow. Please provide 03 Mar 2021 04 Mar 2021 30 Mar 2021 YES NO
copies of the Declaration of Interests of all the Peak
District National Park Authority's Local Access Forum
members.

RESPONSE:
04/03/2021 - Final response, information not held.

_______

PE\2021\ENQ\41688 EIR - PLANNING APPEAL NUMBER 18 Feb 2021 17 Mar 2021 17 Mar 2021 YES
APP/M9496/D/20/3258914 registered 21st September
2020.

Please provide me with copies of the entire
correspondence including the Authority's written
representations document to and from the Planning
Inspectorate, from the 7th September 2020 to date.



